
What did Jesus say about the Holy Spirit?

John 14

 I will ask the Father, and he will give you another helper who will 
be with you forever. 17 That helper is the Spirit of Truth. The world 
cannot accept him, because it doesn’t see or know him. You 
know him, because he lives with you and will be in you.

18 “I will not leave you all alone. I will come back to you. 19 In a 
little while the world will no longer see me, but you will see me. 
You will live because I live. 20 On that day you will know that I am 
in my Father and that you are in me and that I am in you. 
21 Whoever knows and obeys my commandments is the person 
who loves me. Those who love me will have my Father’s love, 
and I, too, will love them and show myself to them.”

22 Judas (not Iscariot) asked Jesus, “Lord, what has happened 
that you are going to reveal yourself to us and not to the world?”

23 Jesus answered him, “Those who love me will do what I say. 
My Father will love them, and we will go to them and make our 
home with them. 24 A person who doesn’t love me doesn’t do 
what I say. I don’t make up what you hear me say. What I say 
comes from the Father who sent me.

25 “I have told you this while I’m still with you. 26 However, the 
helper, the Holy Spirit, whom the Father will send in my name, 
will teach you everything. He will remind you of everything that I 
have ever told you.

27 “I’m leaving you peace. I’m giving you my peace.

________________________________________________________


Acts 1:3

Before he was taken to heaven, he gave instructions through the 
Holy Spirit to the apostles, whom he had chosen.

3 After his death Jesus showed the apostles a lot of convincing 
evidence that he was alive. For 40 days he appeared to them and 
talked with them about God’s kingdom.




4 Once, while he was meeting with them, he ordered them not to 
leave Jerusalem but to wait there for what the Father had 
promised. Jesus said to them, “I’ve told you what the Father 
promises: 5 John baptized with water, but in a few days you will 
be baptized with the Holy Spirit.”

6 So when the apostles came together, they asked him, “Lord, is 
this the time when you’re going to restore the kingdom to Israel?”

7 Jesus told them, “You don’t need to know about times or 
periods that the Father has determined by his own authority. 
8 But you will receive power when the Holy Spirit comes to you. 
Then you will be my witnesses to testify about me in Jerusalem, 
throughout Judea and Samaria, and to the ends of the earth.”

__________________________________________________________


Luke 4:18 - 


"The Spirit of the Lord is on me, because he has anointed me to 
proclaim good news to the poor. He has sent me to proclaim 
freedom for the prisoners and recovery of sight for the blind, to 
set the oppressed free,


________________________________________________________


John 3:5

Jesus answered Nicodemus, “I can guarantee this truth: No one 
can enter God’s kingdom without being born of water and the 
Spirit. 6 Flesh and blood give birth to flesh and blood, but the 
Spirit gives birth to things that are spiritual. 7 Don’t be surprised 
when I tell you that all of you must be born from above. 8 The 
wind[b] blows wherever it pleases. You hear its sound, but you 
don’t know where the wind comes from or where it’s going. 
That’s the way it is with everyone born of the Spirit.”




John 4:21

Jesus told her, “Believe me. A time is coming when you 
Samaritans won’t be worshiping the Father on this mountain or in 
Jerusalem. 22 You don’t know what you’re worshiping. We Jews 
know what we’re worshiping, because salvation comes from the 
Jews. 23 Indeed, the time is coming, and it is now here, when the 
true worshipers will worship the Father in spirit and truth. The 
Father is looking for people like that to worship him. 24 God is a 
spirit. Those who worship him must worship in spirit and truth.”



